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epi
August 13, 2002

epi POSITION PAPER RELATING TO
THE NEW IMPLEMENTING REGULATIONSUNDERTHE EPC2000

I GENERALCOMMENTS

1) It appearsthat the proposednew ImplementingRegulationscontain amendmentsof a
linguistic or clerical characterwhich were not made in order to adaptthe implementing
regulationsto therevisedEPC2000.

The epi questionsthe needfor theseamendments.In fact, such amendmentscould lead to
juridical uncertaintyandinterpretationdifficulties. In manycases,achangemadein only one
language leads to questions as to why the other language versions have not been
correspondinglymodified. Generallyspeaking,the epi would favour maintainingthe status
quo for thewordingof theImplementingRegulationsin thethreeofficial languagesunlessan
amendmentis absolutelynecessaryfor clarificationor, particularly, for harmonizationof the
threeversionsoftheRegulations.

2) As examplesof suchinappropriateamendments,the following maybe cited, evenif they
maynotbethebestexamples:

Rule 1(3) is amendedin the Englishversionby changingthe first words <<documentsto be
usedfor purposesof evidence>> to read<<documentaryevidence>>. ThecorrespondingFrench
versionreading<desdocumentsutiliséscommemoyensde preuve>> remainsunamended.

The corresponding German version presently reading <<SchriflstUcke, die als

Beweismittel . ...> is amendedto read << SchrifflicheBeweismittel...

Theseproposedchangesdo not seemreally necessary.

Rule 2(2), is amendedby changing<<in the caseof oral proceeding,the employeesof the
EuropeanPatentOffice may,insteadofthe languageoftheproceedings,useone oftheother
official languagesoftheEuropeanPatentOffice>> to read:<<in oralproceedings,employees
oftheEuropeanPatentOffice mayuseany official languageoftheEuropeanPatentOfficeas
the languageoftheproceedings>>.

This amendmentseemsto imply that in oral proceedings,it would be possible for EPO
employeesto shift from oneofficial languageto anotherwhilst thepresentwordingseemsto
imply thatonly oneofficial languageshouldbe used.



The correspondingchangeproposedin the French version: <<peuventutiliser une langue
officielle de l’Office EuropéendesBrevetsautre que la languede Ia procedure>>seemsto
haveadifferentmeaningfrom thenewlyamendedEnglishversion.

TheGermanversionis left unamended.

It seemsthereforethat theproposedamendmentsin Rule2(2) tendto introducethepossibility
ofdiscrepanciesin interpretationofthethreeversions.

3) In view ofthefact that thecoming into forceoftherevisedEPC 2000cannotbe expected
for some years, it doesnot appearadvisableto decidenow the definitive wording of the
ImplementingRegulationswhich would thenbe frozenuntil entry into forceof the revised
EPC2000.

The epi thereforestressesthat further amendmentsof the ImplementingRegulationsmay
appearnecessarybeforetherevisedEPC2000comesinto force.

II SPECIFIC COMMENTS ON AMENDED RULES

Thesecommentsare basedmainly on the English version, assumingthat mere clerical or
linguistic changesshouldnotbeconsideredassubstantialchanges.

- Rule 1(3) Languagein written proceedings

Theindication of << aperiodto be specified>>doesnot seemto us to be sufficientlyprecise.
Theepi wouldpreferto indicatethat saidperiodis <<to be specifiedby theEPOin accordance
with theprovisionsofRule84 >>.

- Rule 2(1)Language in oral proceedings

Theproposedamendmentpermitting theuseof any official languageof theEPOduring oral

proceedingsis welcomedbypractitioners.

- Rule 5 Certificationoftranslations

Thestatementof“a periodto be specified” doesnot seemto besufficiently precise.Theepi
would againsuggestindicating that saidperiod is “to be specifiedby the EPOin accordance
with the provisions of Rule 84”. The epi considersthat the sanction for not filing the
certificatein duetime is ratherharshandwewould suggeststatinginsteadthat “the EPOp~y
considerthedocumentasnothavingbeenfiled”.

Thestatement“unless otherwiseprovided”seemsunclearandwe suggestit becancelled.

- Rule 6(1) Filing oftranslationsand reductionof fees

The proposedamendmentwhich is in line with article 6(7) of the PLT togetherwith Rule
41(1)is acceptable.

As thereis apparentlyno doubt that the provision also appliesto divisional applications,
cancellationofthesecondsentenceof presentRule6(1) appearsacceptable.



- Rule 18 Publication of the mention ofthe inventor

The epi feels theproposedamendmentconstitutesa substantivechangeasit would makeit
possiblefor an applicantto avoid designatingan inventorwithout filing evidenceofthe fact
that theinventorhaseffectivelywaivedhis right to be mentioned.

Theepi thereforesuggeststhat theRulebe rewordedto makeclearthat a letter or awritten
statementfrom theinventorhasto be filed attheEPOby theapplicantif an inventordoesnot
wishto be mentioned.Ofcourse,sucha letterorwritten statementshouldbe kept in thenon-
publicpartof thefile.

- Rule 20(1)Registration oftransfers

The epi prefersthe presentwording of Rule 20(1) where it is clear that the EPOmustbe
satisfied by the documentsproducedthat the transfer has effectively taken place. The
proposedamendmentseemsto imply that theEPOwould no longermakeany checkof the
documentsproduced.

The epi alsonotes that registrationof transfers(aswell as licenses)are presentlyaccepted
aftergrantof theEuropeanpatentduring theoppositionprocedure,if any. Consequently,it
could be advisableto extendthe provisionsof Rule 20 (and also of Rules 21 and 22) to
grantedEuropeanpatents.

Registrationof transfersof a patent also seemsrequiredfor the purposesof a limitation
procedureasonly theproprietorcanbe requester.

- Rule 22 Specialentriesfor licenseregistrations

It should be madeclear that these special entries are sub-categoriesof the registration
providedfor in Rule21 andthattherefore,theprovisionsofRule20(1)alsoapply to makinga
recordunderRule22.

- Rule 31 Claims incurring fees

Accordingto theproposedchanges,it appearsthat an applicantwould be liable to pay claims
feeseachtime he files a newsetof claims, thenumberofwhich exceedstenand thenumber
of thepreviouslyfiled claims.

Theepi thereforesuggeststhat this Rulebe amendedto clearlystatethat claimsfeesfor more
thantenclaimsshouldonly be payable“at thefiling” of theapplication.

In caseof amendedset of claims filed during prosecution,any claims fee should only be
payableat the time of acceptanceof the applicationsimultaneouslywith the granting and
printing fees.

- Rule 32(2)(a)Form ofthe drawings

While theuseofcolorson drawingsshouldnormallybe avoided,somesituationsexistwhere
colorsareusefulor evennecessary.



Theepi thereforesuggestsfurtheramendmentof this rule so that coloringwould beaccepted
if reallynecessary.

- Rule34(2)and (3) Prohibitedmatter

Accordingto theproposedchanges,it is not clearwho is responsiblefor omitting prohibited

matterfrom theapplicationaspublished.
Theepi prefersthepreviouswording,makingclearthat theEPO is responsiblefor omitting
suchmatterfrom theapplicationaspublished.
- Rule 35(3) General provisions governing the presentationof the application

documents

Thewords“subjectto paragraph11” shouldread“subjectto paragraph10”.

- Rule38(1)Declarationof priority

It is suggestedthat “file number”shouldbe changedto themoreusualwording“application
number”.

- Rule38a(3)Priority documents

According to theproposedamendment,a translationof a priority documentin a language
otherthan thethreeofficial languagesof the EPOwill not be in the file. A third partywill
haveto maketheirowntranslationin orderto assessthevalidity of thepriority ofthegranted
patent.Theepi, consciousofthePLT provisionson this question,would neverthelesssuggest
addinginto this rule that theEPO could invite the applicantor proprietorof the European
patentto file a translationof thepriority documents“uponrequestof athird party”.

- Rule39 Examinationon filing

It shouldbemadeclearthat thetwo monthsmentionedare“from thenotificationof theEPO”.

- Rule39aMissingpartsof thedescriptionor missingdrawings

Thesamecommentcanbe madeasfor Rule39.

In paragraph1 of Rule 39a, the epi suggestscancelingthe last sentencereading“The
applicantmaynot invoketheomissionof sucha communication”.In fact, theepi considers
that apart inadvertentlyomittedin apatentapplicationshouldnot leadto a completeloss of
rights. Receivinga communicationfrom the EPO protects the applicantagainstsuch an
excessiveconsequence.

- Rule42(2)Subsequentdesignationoftheinventor

This paragraphrelatingto divisional applicationsor to newapplicationsunderArticle 61 is
notclearlyunderstood.



- Rule45 Incompletesearch

The epi considersthat theEPOshould at leastexplain thereasonswhy it considersthat it is
impossible to carryout a meaningful search.The epi suggeststherefore that this rule be
furtheramendedto providefor theEPOto sendareasoneddeclaration.

- Rule46 Europeansearchreportwheretheinventionlacksunity

The proposedchangesnow provide for thepossibilityof theEPO to determinewhich is the
maininvention.

The epi considersthat the applicantis entitled to decideon which invention he wantsthe
searchreport to be established.The epi thereforeprefersthe wording of presentRule 46
wherethesearchis madeon the inventionor the groupof inventions“first mentionedin the
claims”.

- Rule54 Certificatefor a Europeanpatent

The epi suggeststhat the wording be revised to make clear that severalcertificatescan
successivelybeobtaineduponrequestby theproprietorofthepatent.

Thenew wordingcouldpossiblybe drafted,taking into considerationparagraphs1 and 2 of

presentRule54.

- Rule 56(1)Rejectionoftheoppositionasinadmissible

Theepi doesnot agreewith theadditionof Rule 55b, paragraph2(b). Theepi considersthat
an oppositionshouldnot berejectedasinadmissiblesimply becausethetitle of the invention
hasbeenomittedin thenoticeofopposition.

Alternatively,Rule55b(2)(b)couldbe streamlinedby cancellingany referenceto thetitle or
eventhenameofthepatentee.

- Rule57(1)Preparationof theexaminationof theopposition

Theproposedchangescouldbemisunderstood.

Theepiprefersmaintenanceof thepreviouswordingstating“to file amendments”.

- Rule58(1) Examinationof opposition

The epi is concernedaboutthe lengthof theoppositionprocedureandparticularly in caseof
appealwhentheBoard of Appeal refersthecasebackto thefirst instance.In orderto avoid
sucha lengthy procedure,the EPI suggeststhat the oppositiondivision examinesall the
groundsinvokedby theopponentduring theprocedure.

The epi thereforesuggeststhat the proposedwording be further amendedto reflect this
situation.



The proposedwording “the oppositiondivision shall be obliged” appearsstrangeand not
exactly in line with the French and German correspondingversions.The wording “shall
examine”couldbe preferred.

- Rule 58a(2)Maintenanceof theEuropeanpatentin amendedform

With theproposedwording,theperiodof time in which theprescribedfeemustbepaid is not

clear.
It is suggestedto shift “within aperiodto be specified”beforeparagraphsa) andb).

- Rule 63c(2)(c)Requirementsof the request for limitation

In additionto theprovisionsproposed,theepi suggeststhat provisionbemadeaccordingto
which theEPO shall inform a licenseeif sucha licenseeis recordedat theEPO,sothat said
licenseebe awareofa limitation requestfiled by theproprietorof thepatent.

- Rule63eTerminationof limitation proceeding

The epi agreeswith the proposedwording accordingto which the limitation proceedingis
terminatedif an oppositionis subsequentlyfiled. As a matterof fact, theoppositionprocedure
is more balancedbeing an inter partes procedureand the Opposition Division has the
possibility ofalsodecidingon thevalidity of the limited claims,which is not thecaseduring
limitation procedure.

- Rule 63fExamination ofthe request for limitation

Theepi agreesthat the limitationprocedureshouldbe swift and simple.However,this should
not lead to the result that the requesteris obliged to file a new limitation requestupon
immediaterejectionof therequestby the EPO.Consequently,the epi wishesto makeclear
that the ExaminingDivision will authorizetherequesterto answera notification expressing
theopinionoftheExaminingDivision, thuspermitting therequesterto file furtheramended
limited claims.

A correspondingprovisioncouldbe introducedin Rule63for alternativelyin Rule63g(4).
It should also be madeclear that it is possibleto requestdifferent limitations for different
memberstatesoftheEPC.

- Rule 63h Form ofthe amendedEuropean patent specification

Theepi wishesto stressthat thedescriptionoftheEuropeanpatentafterlimitation shouldbe
amendedto reflect the limited claims. Otherwise, the courts and third partiescould have
difficulties in interpretingthescopeofprotectionaccordingto Article 69 EPC.

- Rule 64a(2)and (3)

Concerningparagraph2, the epi prefersthemaintenanceofthepreviouswordingof Article
110 EPC 1973 stating “as often as necessary”.The appeal procedureis an important
procedurewhereboth partiesmusthavethepossibility of presentingall their arguments.It



would be unfair andcontraryto the interestsof both partiesto limit therights ofthepartiesto
file observations.

The epi approvesthe proposedamendmentof paragraph3 in view of the fact that further
processingaccordingto Article 121 EPC will apply to this situation wherethe European
patentapplicationis deemedto bewithdrawn.

- Rule67a(b)Furtherfundamentalproceduraldefects(Procedurefor Review)

The epi is concernedthat the procedurefor Review now introducedcould exaggeratedly

lengthenmanyprocedures.

In orderto limit sucharisk, theproceduraldefectswhich canbe presentedshouldbe defined
in a strictly limited way. While this is the casefor paragrapha), the epi considersthat
paragraphb) leavesthedooropento anykind ofproceduraldefectandis thereforetoo broad.

Theepi suggestsfurther amendingtheproposalby statingin paragraphb) : “decidedon the
appealwithout decidingon aclearlystatedrequestrelevantto thatdecision”.

- Rule 67d(1)Contentsofthe petition for review

Theepi considersthat thepetitionshouldalsocontainthegroundswhich arethebasisofthe
petition.

- Rule67f(1)and(3) Procedurein dealingwith petitionsfor review

Theepi agreesthat theprocedureshouldnotbe exaggeratedlylong. However,in view ofthe
importanceofthematter,includingthepossibilityof cancelingadecisiontakenby aBoardof
Appeal, the epi considersthat theprocedurefor review should be completewith theparties
havingthepossibility of fully explainingtheir arguments.Consequently,thestatementofthe
lastsentence“time limits maybeshortened”which appearsto be somewhatundefined,could
leadto a shortenedandincompleteprocedure.

Theepi thereforesuggeststhat thissentencebe cancelled.

In paragraph3, the epi notes that the procedurefor review accordingto paragraph2(a)

appearsto bean exclusivelywrittenprocedure.

Theepi howeverconsidersthat theright to haveoralproceedingsis afundamentalright ofthe
parties which should not be forgotten even in caseswhich are deemedto be “clear”.
Furthermore,theepi disagreeswith the ideathat theEnlargedBoardofAppealwould decide,
evenin suchsituations,“without the involvementof otherparties” In fact, theotherparties
musthavetheright to presenttheirarguments.

- Rule 72 Decisionon taking of evidence

The title of this rule shouldprobablybetterbe furtheramendedsimply to read“Taking of
evidence”.



Theepi considersthat thehearingof witnessesor expertsshouldalwaysbe recordedsothat a
transcriptof thehearingcouldbe usedafterwardsin thecontinuationof theproceedings.The
epi therefore suggeststhata correspondingprovisionbe introducedin Rule72 or in Rule72b.

- Rule 85a(2)Further processing

Theepi doesnot agreewith the introduction,asexceptionswhich areruledout from further
processing,of the provisions of Rules 41 (correction of deficiencies in the application
documents)and 41a (deficienciesin claiming priority). As a matterof fact, evenif a legal
remedyis providedfor thesituationsmentionedin Rules41 and41a, thosesituationsconcern
small deficienciesfor which theepi doesnot seeany reasonfor excludingfurtherprocessing.

- Rule 85b(3)Reestablishmentof rights

Theproposedrule accordingto which reestablishmentof rights is ruledout in respectof any
periodfor which furtherprocessingis availabledoesnot seemadvisable.In fact, in practice,
difficulties couldstill arisein a situationfor which furtherprocessingcouldhavebeenmade.
Furthermore,the basis of a reestablishmentof rights is the fact that an applicant or a
proprietorwasunableto observeatime limit in spiteof all duecare.It wasnot the intention,
whenrevisingArticle 122EPC,to excludeasageneralruleall thesituationsfor which further
processingis possible.

It would be inequitablefor applicantsand proprietorsto lose their rights, if they failed to
requestfurther processing,whentheycould still show that the non-observanceof thetime
limit, which causedtherefusalof therelevantapplication,couldbe explainedin sucha way
that reestablishmentofrights couldbe obtained.

It mustalsonot be forgottenthat thedifficulty which madeit impossibleto observethetime
limit maywell continueafterexpiryofthetime limit for requestingfurtherprocessing.
For all thesereasons,the epi suggestsmodifying the proposalso asnot to exclude the

situationsfor which furtherprocessingis available.

- Rule 89a(b)Information on prior art

This newly introducedprovision should not give rise to a broad interpretation.The epi
suggeststhat communicationofprior artbe limited to acorrespondingpatentapplication.The
wording could thereforebe completedby stating “concerninga priority application or an
applicationclaimingthesamepriority astheEuropeanpatentapplication”.

- Rule 92(3) Entries in theRegisterof European Patents

The epi doesnot understandthe reasonfor deletingthis paragraph.It mustbe notedthat in
some countries,certified extracts from the Registerof EuropeanPatentsare required(for
exampleto obtainan orderfor “saisie-contrefacon”from aFrenchjudge).

Reintroductionofthis paragraphis thereforesuggested.



- Rule lOla Attorney evidentiary privilege

The epi warmly welcomes this new rule and would like to make the following small
observation.

The French version (Règle lOlbis) should be amendedto replacethe word “client” by the
word “mandant” in accordancewith thewordingoftheFrenchversionof the Regulationon
discipline(Règlementen matièrede disciplinedesmandatairesagrees).

Similarly, theGermanversionof Rule lOla should be amendedby replacing“Mandant” by
“Auftraggeber”for thesamereasonsaspreviouslymentioned.

This would make clearer that the “client” mentionedin the English version can be the
companywhere the professionalrepresentativeis an employee or a subsidiaryof that
company.

- Rule 105(3)

The epi is concernedthat the independenceof thethreememberscomposingthepanelcould
be challenged.It may be arguedthat the proposedwording doesnot exactly comply with
Article 6 oftheEuropeanConventionon HumanRights.

Consequently,the epi suggestsspecifying that the three membersare selectedfrom the
BoardsofAppeal.

FortheEPPC
Axel CASALONGA




